
INTRODUCTION 

R eview question / Objective 1. What is the 
background and scope of research on 
pedagogical models? 2. Which pedagogical 

models have been most systematically reviewed? 
3. Where do the strengths of these pedagogical 
models lie? 4. What weaknesses in instructional 
effectiveness have been identified? 5. Where are 
the research gaps? 

Condition being studied In recent years, there 
has been more and more research on systematic 
evaluation based on teaching models. Therefore, it 
is necessary to conduct a higher-level synthesis of 
the existing review evidence to comprehensively 
identify the background, strengths, weaknesses, 
and gaps of the physical education teaching 
model. 

METHODS 

Search strategy Web of Science, SCOPUS, 
E B S C O h o s t , P u b M e d , P s y c I N F O , a n d 
PsycARTICLES. 

Participant or population Students of all ages. 

Intervention Pedagogical models. 

Comparator Pedagogical models. 

Study designs to be included Systematic review. 

Eligibility criteria Inclusion Criteria：Full-text 
articles published and written in English；Studies 
conducted in the context of physical education；
Participants are students. Exclusion criteria: Non-
scientific evaluation studies; Review studies not 
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focused on the implementation of teaching 
models. 

Information sources Databases: Web of Science, 
SCOPUS, EBSCOhost, PubMed, PsycINFO, and 
PsycARTICLES.


Main outcome(s) 31 systematic review studies 
(before February 17, 2024). 

Quality assessment / Risk of bias analysis Using 
the Assessing the Methodological Quality of 
Systematic Reviews (AMSTAR-2) tool (Shea et al. 
2017). 

Strategy of data synthesis Two independent 
authors independently gathered information from 
each potentially eligible study.


Subgroup analysis Not applicable. 

Sensitivity analysis Not applicable. 

Language restriction Only English. 

Country(ies) involved China; Malaysia. 

Keywords Pedagogical Model; learning outcomes; 
motor; cognitive; affective; social. 
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