
INTRODUCTION 

Review question / Objective: To apply 
meta-analysis to comprehensively evaluate 
the clinical efficacy of traditional Chinese 
medicine in the treatment of viper bites. 

Condition being studied: According to 
literature surveys, relevant departments of 

many hospitals across the country have 
used in-hospital Chinese medicine 
p repara t ions in combina t ion w i th 
conventional methods to treat the disease, 
which have played a certain role in 
improving clinical efficacy, alleviating local 
symptoms, reducing complications and 
shortening the course of the disease. 
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METHODS 

Search strategy: #1"snakebite"［MeSH］
OR "snake bite"［MeSH］OR " snakebites 
"［Title/Abstract］OR " bite, snake 
"［Title/Abstract］OR "envenomation, 
snakeb i te "［T i t l e /Abst rac t］OR " 
s n a k e b i t e e n v e n o m a t i o n "［T i t l e /
Abstract］OR " snakebite envenomations 
“［Title/Abstract］| #2"traditional Chinese 
medicine "［MeSH］OR " traditional 
medicine, Chinese "［Title/Abstract］OR " 
Chinese traditional medicine "［Title/
Abstract］OR " Chinese medic ine, 
traditional “［Title/Abstract］ | #3 #1AND#2 
| # 4 " r a n d o m i z e d c o n t r o l l e d 
t r ia l"［MeSH］OR " c l in ica l t r ia ls , 
r a n d o m i z e d "［M e S H］O R " t r i a l s , 
randomized clinical"［Text Word］OR " 
controlled clinical trials, randomized"［Text 
Word］OR " double blind* "［Text Word］
OR " random allocat* "［Text Word］OR 
"double-blind method"［Text Word］ | #5 
animal［MeSH］NOT human［MeSH］ | #6 
#4 NOT#5 | #7 #3 AND#6. 

Participant or population: Patients, viper 
bite patients who meet international or 
domestic industry-recognized diagnostic 
standards are not limited by gender, age, 
ethnicity, source of cases, and disease 
severity. 

Intervention: The experimental group 
received traditional Chinese medicine 
combined with conventional treatment, and 
t h e c o n t r o l g r o u p r e c e i v e d o n l y 
conventional treatment. 

Comparator: Total effective rate, local 
symptom score, systemic symptom score, 
swelling score, pain score. 

Study designs to be included: The study 
inclusion criteria were as follows: study 
design, randomized controlled trials (RCTs), 
the language is Chinese or English, and 
there is no limit to whether blinding is 

implemented; patients, viper bite patients 
who meet international or domestic 
industry-recognized diagnostic standards 
are not limited by gender, age, ethnicity, 
source of cases, and disease severity. 

Eligibility criteria: study design, randomized 
controlled trials (RCTs), the language is 
Chinese or English, and there is no limit to 
whether blinding is implemented; patients, 
viper bite patients who meet international 
or domestic industry-recognized diagnostic 
standards are not limited by gender, age, 
ethnicity, source of cases, and disease 
severity. 

Information sources: Computer searched 
PubMed, Cochrane library, CNKI, VIP 
database, Wanfang database and Chinese 
Biomedical Literature database to collect 
RCTs literature on the treatment of viper 
bites with traditional Chinese medicine. 

Main outcome(s): In accordance with the 
search strategy, using computer search 
methods, a total of 460 related documents 
were obtained. After using Endnote 
software to check duplicates, 97 duplicate 
documents were excluded. By reading the 
titles and abstracts of the remaining 
documents, 340 documents were excluded 
according to the inclusion and ranking 
criteria. 

Quality assessment / Risk of bias analysis: 
The included RCT studies were evaluated 
us ing the Cochrane R isk o f B ias 
assessment tool.Using Stata 15. 1 software 
to test the publication bias of the studies 
that recorded the total effective rate index. 

Strategy of data synthesis: The RevMan5.4 
software provided by the Cochrane 
Collaboration was used for meta-analysis 
of the included literature. For continuous 
variables, the mean difference (MD) is 
selected, and the relative risk (RR) is 
selected as the effect size analysis for 
binary variables, and the 95% confidence 
interval (CI) is calculated at the same time. 
Heterogeneity analysis between the results 
of the included studies was evaluated by 
using the chi-square test. If I2≤50%, P≥0.1, 
it indicates that there is homogeneity 
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among multiple studies; if I2>50%, P<0.1, it 
indicates If there is heterogeneity among 
multiple studies, the reasons for the 
heterogeneity shall be further analyzed, 
and the subgroup analysis shall be carried 
out according to related factors. In view of 
the clinical heterogeneity of interventions 
such as hospital preparations, the data in 
this study are analyzed by random effects 
models. If the heterogeneity between 
subgroups is too large, a descriptive 
analysis will be performed, and sensitivity 
analysis will be used to test the stability of 
the results. 

Subgroup analysis: According to the 
treatment method of the experimental 
group, some studies were subgrouped, of 
which were hospital preparation group, and 
some studies were a combination of 
hospital preparations and Chinese patent 
medicines. 

Sensitivity analysis: Using Stata 15.1 to 
conduct sensitivity analysis on the studies 
that recorded the total effective rate index, 
and in RevMan5.4 software, the effect size 
and P value change were observed by 
excluding the included studies one by one. 

Country(ies) involved: China. 

Keywords: Traditional Chinese medicine; 
Agkistrodon halys bite; Meta-analysis. 
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